
























PROJECT 
Street Seats 

JUSTIFICATION 
In a response to the economic and health impacts of the current pandemic, Vino Oregon Inc., 
and its subsidiaries found a health oriented and objective project that would benefit the greater 
good of the Newberg city business district.  

In an attempt to bring new, and continue the current, tourism and shopping in the downtown 
Newberg business district while keeping a healthy and correct response to the Covid-19 
pandemic, The proposed project of ‘street seats’ would benefit multiple areas including 2.9, 
2.11 and 1.8 of this ARPA Project award. 

Social Goods Market and Vino Oregon Inc., under the same umbrella, have a pending 
submission of 'Street Seats’ as approved and pending by the City of Newberg, prior to the 
pandemic’s onset. Since 2020 the project has been in pending status due to it’s funding and 
ability to launch while maintaining a ‘new daily’ operation of the company. 

This project would realize outside seating. 

1.9 : Seating with a safe distance from others, while in an open, outdoor, environment would 
not only create a safety realm of operations that the community would agree helps decrease 
the spread of the Covid-19 virus.   

2.9 : Outside seating would increase the ability of the organization to serve cliental thereby 
creating an increase in revenue allowing for more jobs, local purchases for other vendors, and 
full circle economic health through the City of Newberg.  Vino Oregon Inc. suffered a major loss 
in revenue and it’s ability to serve its employees, customers, and support local vendors. By this 
simple solution there would be an additional revenue stream create that would have a major 
positive impact through the community. 

2.11 : Creating an additional environment for people who are coming to visit the City of 
Newberg and the valley, this environment would be welcoming and allow for people from all 
backgrounds and beliefs of operation from the pandemic. People would feel safe, secure, and 
healthy with the creation of a venue that without a doubt creates a safe space. This is an 
obvious attraction and need that can easily be met with the street seat project completion. 

 

The cost of this project is projected at $34,500.  

This budget includes professional plans drafted, construction, beautification and aesthetics, 
structural integrity and marketing. 



 

The projected project is expected to take 90 days to complete and open to the public. This 
would set it just in time for the Spring tourist season. 

 

PROJECT SUSTAINABILITY 
The creation of a safe space, street seating, would be sustainable into the long future of the 
downtown growth and development programs. 

Vino Oregon Inc. has been a proud member of the commerce of Newberg since 2015. Since it’s 
realization there has been arguably millions of dollars spend locally with local community 
businesses, employment, and growth and development contributions.  

With this addition it is seen that the seating will last as long as the City of Newberg will support 
the permit and approve it’s existence. Vino Oregon Inc will be responsible for the maintenance 
and operation of the project as well as promotion and management. As a draw to the 
downtown City of Newberg people will enjoy spending local dollars with local vendors and 
businesses and create a health commerce. Local construction will be used to realize the project. 
Local design and art craftsmen will be used to ensure its beautification requirements are met.  

This project will be a staple in the recovery from the damage the pandemic has down to 
economy of our beautiful City of Newberg and be a draw for tourism and local involvement for 
many years to come.   

 

ARPA Expenditure Categories  
1.9 and/or 2.9 and/or 2.11 and/or 2.13 and/or 2.14 
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